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The Place of Meeting and the Word (Ex. 25:10-22)

   All mankind must meet and must receive the word. The place 
to receive the word is in Christ. If problems did not exist for 
mankind, there would be no reason for the Lord to come to the 
earth. If it was possible for mankind to solve their problems on 
their own there would be no reason for the Lord to come. 
However, that’s not the case. When mankind face a critical prob-
lem they have no choice but to acknowledge this fact. However, 
the problems that mankind face do not end at physical problems. 
Whenever we speak of problems we only think of them as phys-
ical problems. However, they are stuck and seized by spiritual 
problems. Mankind became separated from God, became cursed as 
sinners, and enslaved by satan. This is a sure fact but when you 
relay this truth to others they are not moved by these words. It is 
a story that has no connection with them whatsoever. It’s tremen-
dous if mankind comes to see that they are separated from God. 
Yet, if you tell them that all mankind are sinners they are not 
moved. When you relay to them that they have no choice but to 
be enslaved by Satan they question why. However, that is not the 
case for the bible. All mankind is seized and enslaved by satan. 
Many are not touched by this truth however, from time to time 
there are people who are touched by these words. They begin to 
live a special life. The moment it becomes their own they are able 
to see that it is the sure word of God upon them. God’s word 
will be concrete to their lives. There are many examples written in 
the bible as well as in church history. That is why the fact that 
all mankind are separated from God and are cursed sinners who 
have no choice but to be enslaved by Satan is not a story. This is 
the realistic and fundamental truth. The cause of all problems is 
because of this. There is nobody that can resolve the fundamental 
problem on their own. To be honest, it’s very rare for people to 
even acknowledge this. Many people pray to God but yet are not 
able to connect to God heart to heart because they are unable to 
see this fact. We must be thankful because as we continuously lis-
ten to the message our spiritual eyes have opened. However, this 
is the problem that has no choice but to come because the cove-
nant has been broken between God and mankind. This must truly 
come inside of your heart and yourself. This problem has no 
choice but to come because the covenant was broken. That is why 
you must reestablish this covenant. There is no other way except 
to reestablish the covenant. It must be the covenant that Christ 
must be reestablished once again. Mankind was created to not face 
any problems. Up until this day if Adam and Eve didn’t eat from 
the tree of good and evil there would be no problems. However, 
the covenant was broken and they became a prey to satan. This 
truth must come inside of your heart to the extent that you are 
able to see why it must be only Christ. From the onset angels 
were servants of mankind. Yet, Satan is the fallen angel from 
heaven. The angels are servants to all mankinds yet, the fallen an-

gel satan devours all mankind and we have become a prey to 
satan. After this fundamental problem everyone has been devoured 
and seized by satan. That is why without God’s grace all of man-
kind has no choice but to end up in hell. There is not a single 
exception. However, the only way for you to be saved from this is 
Jesus Christ. God permitted you to receive answers when you hold 
to the covenant of Chrust and enjoy it. Your life will change when 
you receive continuous answers. Your life cannot change if you do 
not receive answers. You must receive answers from God so that 
your thoughts can change as well and the doors of evangelism will 
be opened. You will go towards the 237 nations and world 
evangelization. This is the most blessed blessing God has given to 
us. Nothing else is greater than this answer that God has given to 
us. Everything else will one day pass. We must be able to live 
with a mindset that looks towards heaven. It is wisdom to have 
the standard of heaven as your own. You are greatly deceived if 
you fall into the ideology of the world as your own standards or 
continuously listen to the words of others. That is why this wor-
ship must be just like Abel’s worship. God must receive this wor-
ship and our prayers. There is only one answer to that which is 
for you to hold to the covenant and give worship. God will not 
receive worship that does not hold to the covenant. Surely enough, 
God will receive your worship and prayer that holds to the 
covenant. May you receive many answers as it becomes the cove-
nantal worship before God. May you not be oppressed or dragged 
by your life but may you conquer it. May you give the sure an-
swer that it is only by Jesus Christ alone to those who are facing 
problems. 

1. The Place of Meeting and the Word
Today’s scripture explains to the people how to make the ark of 
the covenant. When you read it you are not able to picture it in 
your head. The ark of the covenant is expressed as the ark of the 
testimony or the ark of the law. It speaks about the mercy seat as 
well as the most holy place. Underneath is the ark of the covenant 
and on the top is the cherubim that is the mercy seat. This is 
placed inside the most holy place. The Lord said in today's scrip-
ture, “this is the place I will meet you and this is the place where 
I will give you the word.” Inside the ark of the testimony contains 
the stone tablets of the ten commandments for that is God’s word. 
Also placed inside is Aaron’s budded rod. You all know the story 
of Aaron’s budded rod. There was an uproar during the time re-
garding Moses as well, his younger sister. That is why they nit-
picked and said, “How is Aaron the only special one? We are all 
special as well.” God tells Moses to gather two representatives of 
every tribe. Moses tells the representative leaders of the 12 tribes 
to bring a dry rod with them and put their name on the rod. 
Moses commands Aaron to do the same as well. He gathers all 
the rods and puts them in the holiest place and the next day he 
goes to gather them. All the eleven rods were all the same. It was 



임마누엘남가주교회 Immanuel Church of Southern California

only Aaron’s rod that was budded to the extent that there were 
blossoms and flowers. What is the message of that? God’s message 
is that we think that everything is the same, but to God everything 
is different. Aaron was the one that God specifically chose. God 
chose everyone else, but yet Aaron was different. This signifies 
Christ who is the priest. Aaron at the time was the priest. Aaron’s 
budded rod was placed inside the Ark of the Testament and also 
the jar of manna. The jar of manna signifies the living body of 
Jesus Christ. The word became flesh, the word is Jesus Christ. 
When they crossed the Jordan River, God told them to follow the 
Ark of the Covenant. When they were circling the Jericho wall, 
God told them to follow the Ark of the Covenant. That is how 
works arose. God’s message is to say that this is who Christ is. It 
was Christ who was placed in the holiest place. All the objects in-
side of the temple signify Christ. There is a water basin in the 
temple and before they enter, they must wash. In other words, they 
must wash or forgive their sins before they enter. That represents 
the mercy seat to which that is the place where they meet Christ 
and are forgiven of their sins. The mercy seat being on top of the 
ark signifies that when you meet Christ all your sins will be 
forgiven. This took place 1,500 years before Jesus came to Earth 
and said that he is the way. At the time, he prophesied his words. 
Only through Christ can you be forgiven of your sins. God says 
that he will do two important things. That is stated in verse 22. 
“There I will meet with you.” This is the only place that God has 
promised to the people where he will meet them. Then what must 
they do? Those who desire to meet God must meet him at the 
place God tells them to meet him. Because it is God’s promise, 
God will surely meet them. That is the mercy seat on top of the 
ark. In this present time, the mercy seat signifies Jesus Christ. 
There is not a single creation that can live without God. Even the 
sun and moon will not exist anymore if God does not exist. In the 
end times, when the sun and the moon and the stars no longer ex-
ist, everything is finished because it is the word that God 
proclaimed. That is why all mankind must meet God. They must 
eternally meet God, that is by accepting Jesus Christ in their heart. 
After they receive Jesus Christ in their heart, they must meet him 
every single day. It is far better for them to continuously meet 
God through all incidents for 24 hours and in all things that they 
do. From there you must be strengthened by God. All mankind 
must do this. To be honest, all the things that you think belong to 
you all belong to God. Do you think that even a strand of hair 
belongs to you? Do you think that your fingernails belong to you? 
Do you think that you have grown these fingernails? No, nothing 
belongs to you because everything that you possess, you have re-
ceived from God. You have received it all from God and you 
must continuously receive it from God. You must receive it every 
single day from God. This is a normal life. This is who mankind 
has been created to be. If they don’t do that they just merely live 
their lives. Then they will be at loss. May you meet God every 
single day for you have eternally met him. You are meeting him 

for 24 hours. That is why you must hold to the covenant. That is 
24. May this blessing be upon us all. The world cannot overcome 
us. Even the words of others can never influence your life. It does 
not matter if problems arise for that alone you will have conquest, 
victory, and you will be able to challenge it. Secondly, what is 
most important for mankind is that they must receive the word 
from God. Of course, they don’t have to receive God’s words. For 
the believers, they will truly be at a loss, and for the nonbelievers, 
because they don’t believe in God, they will end up in hell. They 
can never die. God always gives his word and fulfills it. May you 
think about it once again. God does according to his word. Do 
you believe in this? May you hold to it as your covenant and nev-
er change. What is the answer to your life? For you to receive the 
word from God. If you receive the eternal word of God for your 
entire life, then everything is finished for you. Miracles have no 
choice to arise if you continuously receive God’s word weekly. 
When you receive God’s word, all the hardships and problems that 
you are going through will all be resolved. Miracles will arise 
even if you may not receive this word weekly, maybe once or 
twice throughout a year. All mankind must be like this, but for the 
children of God, they must live their life like this. This is your 
answer. This is the complete answer that will bring miracles to 
their life. It is the past words of others when they say, “ I have 
not received answers because I have not prayed to God.” If you 
just firmly hold to Christ and follow the word of God, even if 
you do not pray, answers are bound to come. All things will be 
overturned if you just simply hold to the covenant, follow his 
word, and pray. God did not create heaven and earth with any 
ingredients. God proclaimed the word and they were created. There 
is evidence to this. A representative piece of evidence is the five 
loaves and two fish. With the five loaves and two fish, 5,000 men 
were fed. Not only that, there were twelve baskets left over. Who 
is able to do the same work that he has done? There has never 
once been a case like this. There is not a single person who even 
wrote a story regarding this. It is because it is so obvious that 
they are lying when they do so. Do you think that the five loaves 
and two fish were ingredients? Do you believe that with those in-
gredients alone, 5,000 men were fed and 12 baskets remained? If 
that’s the case, then anyone can utilize the ingredients and accom-
plish the same thing. The water turned to wine. How is it possible 
that water turned into wine? Was water an ingredient? Yet, even if 
man had all the water, it’d be impossible for them to turn it into 
alcohol. Jesus simply said the words, and the water turned into 
wine. It was not achieved by ingredients but by His word. May 
you really question yourself. Do I truly believe in this? May you 
come to the conclusion. If you truly believe that it is by the 
Word, you will stake your life for the Word. Everything will be 
finished by receiving this Word, and that is more than enough. 
You wouldn’t do anything else but receive His Word. You will be 
able to fulfill your life with the Word alone. And God said, “At 
that place where I will meet you, I will give you the Word.” So, 
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how precious is that place? That is why that place was the most 
holy place of all places. You must receive this Word. You must 
never forget that the mercy seat where God will meet you is 
where Christ is. And the ark of the covenant signifies Jesus Christ. 
Where can mankind receive forgiveness of sins? They must be for-
given of their sins in order to meet God. That is why it is so im-
portant that He died on your behalf. You must be forgiven of sin 
in order to receive God’s word. God will not give you His Word 
if your sins have not been forgiven. That is why accepting Christ 
is important. God promised, “At that place, I will give you My 
Word.” He promised that, at the mercy seat that signifies Jesus 
Christ, He will give you His Word. Reverend Ryu has received the 
commission of world evangelization. Why do you think God gave 
him that commission? It was because he was in Christ. It was be-
cause his understanding of the Gospel was exceptional. He didn’t 
receive the commission of world evangelization and then came to 
know Christ. Many believe it doesn’t really matter what comes 
first, but that’s not the case. That is why God says, “Inside of 
Christ, I will give you the Word.” When you hold to, enjoy, and 
confess the covenant of Christ, God will one day give you His 
Word. As you listen to weekly messages or the Prayer Journal 
message and just continuously listen to the Word, God will give 
you the lifelong Word. And because God has given you that life-
long Word, He will fulfill that Word throughout your life. You 
will be in the covenant journey in which you are led by that 
Word. No one can block it. You will not be shaken by the words 
of others. It is because, through that Word alone, you will have 
complete conquest. With that Word alone, Satan’s kingdom will be 
bound. At that time, the demons will try to hinder you. With the 
Word alone, they will be bound. You will be able to overcome all 
the works of the demons with the Word alone. Your life will be 
completely set free from all curses. You will have complete lib-
eration from all that you are enslaved to. And the Bible states that 
you will not only come out, but you will come out with great 
treasures. That was proclaimed in Genesis 15:14. It was fulfilled in 
Exodus 12:35-36. That was about five hundred years later. So, in-
side of Christ, may you receive your lifelong Word, your 
commission. God said He will proclaim His Word at the mercy 
seat, so you must remain inside of Christ. Where can you meet 
God? There is only one place, and that place is the mercy seat. 
Where can you receive God’s Word? It is the same from then to 
right now. There is only one place in the world, and it is the mer-
cy seat. That mercy seat is Jesus Christ, the covenant. So, may 
you enjoy Christ. May you once again hold onto Jesus Christ as 
your covenant. This is the answer. One day, when you receive the 
lifelong commission, you will go into a more detailed answer. The 
only thing left is to hold onto that lifelong commission as the 
covenant. Then, work will continuously arise. Moses is the one 
who recorded Genesis 3:15. He knew about Satan and the 
offspring. On top of that, God gave Moses the Word to go to 
Canaan. No one was able to block this. And in this age, God’s 

method is the same. That is why, once again, may it be only 
Jesus Christ. And may you receive the covenantal Word. As time 
goes on, this will become your heavenly mandate. Then, you’ll 
come to realize why God has led you to the Gospel. That is your 
calling. You will hold onto that Word as your lifelong covenant 
and live going towards that. God gives those people deep prayer. 
It’s because they are someone who will do exactly as God’s Word 
says. It’s because they are the one who will be used to fulfill the 
Word. And when the Word is about to be fulfilled, there will be 
many hindrances around them. At that moment, should they simply 
give up? They should stand even firmer. What do they need in or-
der to stand even firmer? They need to receive more spiritual 
strength. Even if there are many problems that arise, they will not 
be shaken. They will hold onto God’s Word and head towards it. 
That was Moses and Paul. There were countless people who tried 
to hinder Moses. How difficult must it have been to live in the 
wilderness? However, he was not seized by that. He was not 
shaken. Why would he be? God is giving us the message today 
that He is giving this Word in this place. Shouldn’t we receive it? 
From there, your confession will become deeper. Your spiritual 
power is gained through Christ. The deeper you enjoy Christ, the 
deeper power you will receive. There is no other place God has 
chosen. That is the only place which is Jesus Christ. We all know 
the story of King Hezekiah. During the time of the Israelites, there 
was only one place to meet God which was at the temple. At the 
time, many wanted to give worship and repent, but, although Israel 
was small, the temple was a pretty far distance. And they were 
busy with their farming and harvesting. So, instead of going all the 
way to Jerusalem, people would go to the top of the mountain and 
build an altar. It was convenient, and they also believed that they 
were closer to God at the top of the mountain, so they captured 
their lamb there and gave it as a blood sacrifice to God. Many of 
the kings who were against it simply let it be. Yet, King Hezekiah 
went through the entire city and broke all the altars. It’s because 
there was only one place to meet God and give worship: 
Jerusalem. His point of view was that God was the one that gave 
the harvest, allowed them to farm, and poured rain for them to 
live. How could they say they were too busy? So, for the 
Israelites, God wasn’t their everything and only. They only went to 
Jerusalem to give worship when they had time. That is why King 
Hezekiah broke down all the altars the people made. I am not 
quite sure but I do believe that King Hezekiah was on a horse and 
took his troops and got rid of all the altars that the people have 
made. That is when the work arose in which the 185,000 enemies 
were put to death. The King of Assyria asked them to bring them 
gold stones and gave it to the king. Even when they receive it, 
the opponents would never leave them alone. They wanted more 
gold from the Israelites. That is when they began to take the gold 
from the pillars of the Temple and gave it to them. Even with 
that, they were not satisfied, but wanted more. There was nothing 
more that the Israelites could give. King Hezekiah, who was so an-
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gry that all was taken away from them, wanted to fight them. On 
that night, King Kezekiah resolved to pray that night as God put 
the 185,000 enemies to death. The king alone was able to survive 
as he went back to his own palace to give idol worship. But at 
that movement, his two sons went back to kill him. That is how 
the 185,000 enemies were put to death. What is the message God 
wants to relay through this message? You must live like King 
Hezekiah. Are you Only God or is God simply an accessory to 
you? Some people may listen to sermons in which the pastor is 
very stern, but may you not be discouraged, but see it as a time 
to repent before the Lord. You shouldn’t be mixing yourself with 
God and the things of the world or hold God as an accessory. 
You must be able to go all in and have only within God alone. 
Spiritually, you must challenge with only Jesus Christ and head to-
wards 237 world evangelization. For the young adults and 
Remnants, you cannot tell what is in the far future. When I look 
at my past, I really had no clue as to what was to come. It is 
right of us to not know what is to come because we cannot see 
the future. That is why when you enjoy Christ, that is when you 
will have the answer. God will give you a concrete answer. Jesus 
Christ is the fundamental answer He has given to you. He is the 
spiritual answer that you all need. When you enjoy Jesus Christ, 
He will give you a concrete answer. That is His Word. he will 
give you the personal Word. When you receive the personal Word 
from God, there is no one that will overcome you. Even though 
Satan may hinder you, it is of no use. If you live heading towards 
God’s Word, God will completely resolve all things for you. This 
is the believer’s life. May you live this life. What is your hope? 
How will you raise your children? What do you hope your child 
could become? There is only one way for your child to do all 
things in this world as they head towards only. It is Jesus Christ. 
When you go inside of deep prayer, you will reach 24. Without 
Christ, 24 cannot take place. If you are putting Christ aside and 
head towards 24, then that person will have no choice but to face 
mental illness. Yet, it must be Christ who is their 24. Inside of 
Christ, God’s desire must take place for 24 hours. Then, you will 
not face mental illnesses. Automatically, when you are within 24, 
the answers of 25 will take place. Within 25, there is no effort 
that needs to be put in. 25 has no choice but to take place, as it 
leads to eternity. As you receive a continuous answer, you will see 
that it is all transcended in time and place. When we see one an-
swer from God, we see that it transcends time and place. However, 
do you think God has given us the word “transcends time and 
place” just to give us one answer? We have received countless an-
swers from God, but how come he has not given us the answer to 
transcend time and place. It is not an average Word, but is the 
Word that can be used by those that have the prayer realm taking 
place deeply within them. You will be able to abundantly enjoy 
the throne of heaven as time and space are being transcended. 
Then, when you stay put, you will be able to shine the light to 
your 237. God says that he will give you His Word at that place. 

You must receive the Word. This is the word God has given to us 
as the promise. God says “I will give you the Word that will tran-
scend the time and space of your life, so you must meet me here 
at that place. You must meet be at that place, at the mercy seat 
which signifies Jesus Christ. There are those that may question 
God, “How come you do not give me your Word?” You must 
wait. You must wait at the place that you are at. If you go some-
where else, you cannot receive God’s Word. It will not take place. 
He only gave you one promise towards all the problems that have 
come from Genesis 3 and that is Jesus Christ. This is the start and 
you must go to the very end holding onto this. For someone that 
says, “I will no longer confess Christ because I am in the high 
level of transcending time and space,” that person has gone crazy. 
Just because you transcend time and place does not mean that you 
simply enjoy that. Do you think you just enjoy the prayer to tran-
scend time and space? What it means for you to transcend time 
and space is for you to enjoy Jesus Christ who will transcend time 
and space on your behalf. We are truly thankful that we have re-
ceived this gospel that is so accurate. We are truly thankful that 
we are continuously and spiritually growing more and more. I bless 
you all in the name of the Lord as you enjoy Christ, the throne of 
heaven, who transcends time and space, and will shine the light to 
the 237 nations. I do believe that God will give you His grace so 
that you will receive His Word. 


